---------- Forwarded message ----- -

From: PACE Program <pace-scheme@birac.nic.in>

Date: Thu, Feb 8, 2024 at 2:12 PM _ o . N
Subject: 1st Release order 17 sfiucusifgnfeim §Reege/  Avinashilingam
Institute AIR01521 .

To: lalitha chem <lalitha chem@avinuty.ac.in>

Cc: Head Investment <investment@birac.nic.in>, BIRAC CRS DBT

<biraccrs.dbt@nic.in>

Dear Mam,
PFA the first release order in project. Start date of the project is: 17.01.2024

Payment Processed (UTR detail):
06/02/2024 06:21:13 PM - CMS/001376007036/24020624028623-N DR 1258200

Kindly acknowledge the receipt of funds

Best regards.
Dr. Poonam Singh
PACE Program Manager

f&ieh/Date 05.01.2024

-‘CP{/TO,

Dr. P. Lalitha

Director R&D

Avinashilingam Institute for Home Science

and Higher Education for Women

Bharathi Park Rd, near Forest College Campus,
Saibaba Colony, Coimbatore, Tamil Nadu 641043
Email- lalitha_chem@avinuty.ac.in

Hed: 0y afdieEr & Ziiid/Ref PACE Project Title "Product development of a
patented weedicide formulation for the management of Eichhornia crassipes and to
develop value-added products from the biomass "

Dear Dr. Lalitha,

With reference to your above, mentioned PACE proposal, we are pleased to inform
that your proposal has been approved by BIRAC at a total cost of 41.94 Lakhs
(Rupees Forty-One Lakhs and Ninety -Four Thousands only). The contribution of
BIRAC  is41.94 Lakhs  (Rupees Forty-One Lakhs and Ninety -Four

Thousands only). as Grant-in-aid o the Avinashilingam Institute for HSc and HE(
for Women.




If you are in acceptance with the terms of funding support as mentioned in the GLA,
the following documents should be executed within a time period of TWO WEEKS
from the date of issue of this communication

Grant-in-aid Letter Agreement (GLA) including all the Schedules: All pages
to be clearly initialled by the Fund Recipients.
e Grantin-aid Letter Agreement (GLA) including all the Schedules: All pages to be
clearly initialled with proper stamp by the Fund Recipient.
* Letter of Authorization from the institute in the prescribed format of BIRAC
* Original copy of Bank Details on the Institute's letter head (with proper attested
stamp)

The Grant-in-Aid Letter agreement has been executed by BIRAC and kindly take a
colour printout of this GLA and the schedules and share the scan copy of GLA and all
above documents on email. Once the scan documents are reviewed you may
dispatch all the original documents along with GLA at BIRAC for further execution.

The first instalment of fund release will be made only after completion of all these
formalities and upon submission of above mentioned documents as per norms.
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Dr. Sanjay Saxena

General Manager & Head (Investment)
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Warm Regards
Dr. Poonam Singh

Senior Manager-Investment

(PACE)



